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RECOMMENDATION ON PAGE 2 
RECOMMENDATION 

It is recommended that the Grants Committee recommend that Halifax Regional Council authorize the 
Mayor and Municipal Clerk to negotiate and enter into a less than market value lease agreement with 
Needham Preschool and Daycare for the premises located at Needham Community Center, 3372 
Devonshire Avenue, Halifax and such lease agreement shall contain key terms and conditions substantially 
similar to those set out in Table 1 in the discussion section of this report. 

BACKGROUND 

The former City of Halifax and the Halifax Regional Municipality upon amalgamation provided 
preschool/daycare services at the Needham Pool & Community Recreation Centre through its Parks and 
Recreation Services department until 1999 as their mandate had changed, and they ceased to provide 
daycare services. In efforts to keep the preschool/daycare open at this location, a group of citizens formed 
a society in February 1999 called Needham Preschool and Daycare and have been operating a preschool 
and daycare from this location since April 1999. 

Since 1999, the Needham Preschool and Daycare have taken the opportunity to sign several less than 
market value lease agreements with the gross rent ranging from $1 per annum to $5 dollars per square 
foot.  In early 2013, staff discussed with the Needham Preschool and Daycare that they would be moved 
to a market value lease and that the market rate would be in the range of $17-$22 dollars per square foot. 
The market value range was confirmed through a third-party market research survey to be between $16-
$23 dollars per square foot for comparable properties, HRM determined $14 dollars per square foot to be 
the fair market value for this space due to limitations regarding accessibility, parking, operating hours and 
the mandatory closure of the preschool and daycare if HRM cancels their programs due to weather 
conditions. 

In 2014, HRM made the change to offer them a market value lease agreement for a term of 1 year at a 
gross rent of $14 dollars per square foot.  This shift was to provide a more equitable gross rent between 
non-profits located in HRM owned facilities and those which are not.  Subsequently in April 2015, the 
Needham Preschool and Daycare entered into a 5-year term with the gross rent starting at $14 dollars per 
square foot and increased annually with year five at $16 dollars per square foot.  The current 2-year lease 
extension continued their gross rent of sixteen $16 dollars per square foot and was signed in advance on 
August 17, 2018.  The Needham Preschool and Daycare requested their extension be completed early to 
provide proof of the requirement of a minimum of a 2 years remaining on their lease for the Space 
Conversion Grant which they applied for through the Department of Education and Early Childhood 
Development.  This grant was to assist with the costs associated with the small renovations required to 
have their license revised to change the capacity from 55 to 56 children and the age range from 3 years to 
18 months.  

The Needham Pool & Community Recreation Centre is scheduled to be replaced with a new facility and is 
anticipated to be ready for occupancy in April 2028, as outlined in the 2022-2023 draft Capital Plan.  The 
current facility will remain operational until the new facility is complete on the site across the street which 
will eliminate the need for swing space during construction.  With the above noted timeline, staff are 
confident that a 5-year lease agreement with the Needham Preschool and Daycare will not have an impact 
on the closure of the Needham Pool & Community Recreation Centre when the new facility is completed. 

The purpose of Administrative Order 2020-013-OP, the Child Care Administrative Order on November 17, 
2020, is to outline a process to prioritize the inclusion of child care centres within facilities owned by the 
Municipality when excess space is available and, further, when leasing spaces to non-profit child care 
centres in HRM-owned facilities, the Municipality shall, subject to the approval of Halifax Regional Council 
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contained in this report, there will be an annual reduction of approximately $20,000 in HRM Parks and 
Recreation’s rental revenue. 

Property taxes are billed initially by the Municipal Government, HRM as Landlord will pay the property taxes 
through D510-5508 as a clearing account.  The Landlord shall invoice the Tenant the property taxes plus 
HST.  Should Regional Council continue to approve the inclusion of the Needham Preschool and Daycare 
to Administrative Order 2014-001-ADM Tax Relief to Non-Profit Organizations, the amount offset will 
represent an additional ‘operating grant’ from HRM.   

RISK CONSIDERATION 

Risk consideration is Low. The Needham Preschool and Daycare is an established, provincially 
registered non-profit with a valid lease agreement in place. These factors reduce the risk considerations 
for the Municipality. 

COMMUNITY ENGAGEMENT 

No community engagement was required. 

ENVIRONMENTAL IMPLICATIONS 

No environmental implications were identified. 

ALTERNATIVES 

1. The Grants Committee could recommend that the Regional Council lease the Premises at market value
to the Needham Preschool and Daycare.

2. The Grants Committee could recommend that the Regional Council lease the property to the Needham
Preschool and Daycare for a longer term.

ATTACHMENTS 

No attachments. 

______________________________________________________________________ 

A copy of this report can be obtained online at halifax.ca or by contacting the Office of the Municipal Clerk at 
902.490.4210. 

Report Prepared by: Tara Legge, Leasing Officer, Corporate Real Estate, Corporate Customer Services 
902.476.2296    
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